
FORM OF SHORT TENDER NOTICE

GECTCR/2196/2024-D3                                        Government Engineering
College Thrissur
                                                                                                                                 
  04-09-2024

 

Sealed tenders are invited for purchase of Sports Uniforms Engineering
Department  of this institution
D3/28/2024-24 Total Rs :136030/--
The envelopes containing the tender should bear the superscription “Tender.
No.D3/28/2024-24  due on 23/09/2024  2.00 pm and should be addressed to
the Principal, Government. Engineering. College, Thrissur, Kerala..Price will
remain  firm from the date of opening of tender to six months.

       Last date for receipt of tenders will be  23/09/2024  2.00 pm Late tenders
will not be accepted. The  tenders will  be  opened  at Government Engineering
College Thrissur   on 24/09/2024  11.00 AM in the presence of such of the
tenderers or their authorized representatives who may be present at that time.
Intending tenderers may, on application to the Principal, Govt. Engineering.
College, Thrissur, obtain the requisite tender forms on which tenders should be
submitted. Application for the tender form should be accompanied by a cash
remittance  of   Rs.472 + postal charge (400+18% GST(Rs 72) )which is the
price fixed for a form/set of forms and which is not refundable under any
circumstances. The tender forms are not transferable. Sale of tender forms will
be closed at   23/09/2024  2.00 pm Cheques, postage stamps, etc., will not be
accepted towards the cost of forms, nor will the forms be sent per V.P.P.   

  Tenders should be accompanied by EMD of 1%, subject to a minimum of Rs.
1500/- ,of the amount by DD drawn in favour of the Principal,
Government.Engineering College, Thrissur with an agreement in Kerala Stamp
Paper worth Rs.220/-.  Details can be had from the Govt.Engineering College
Office during   working hours.                                               

                                                                                                     

Principal
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1. Notice Board

2. Dr. Shejin K V HOD PHYSICAL EDUCATION
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